
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0399

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Rubber Safety Boots & Rubber Hip Boots

TIME & (January 1, 2016 through December 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 7, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 RUBBER SAFETY BOOTS UNIT

 500 pairs PRICE 19.36 21.81 37.41 46.95 30.95

1. Rubber Safety Boots, per specifications or approved equal for sizes from 6-13 TOTAL 9,680.00 10,905.00 18,705.00 23,475.00 15,475.00

  

 Mfg. Onguard Onguard LaCrosse LaCrosse Onguard

 Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #86312 #86312 #24009091 #24009043 #86312

UNIT

50 pairs PRICE 32.56 21.81 38.41 46.95 44.24

2. Rubber Safety Boots, per specifications or approved equal for size over 13 TOTAL 1,628.00 1,090.50 1,920.50 2,347.50 2,212.00

 

Mfg. LaCrosse Onguard LaCrosse LaCrosse LaCrosse

Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #24009043 #86312 #24009091 #24009043 #29009043

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 11,308.00 11,995.50 20,625.50 25,822.50 17,687.00

GROUP 2 RUBBER HIP BOOTS  UNIT      

 800 pairs PRICE 53.68 60.44 74.27 74.95 85.81

3. Rubber Hip Boots, per specifications or approved equal for sizes from 6-13 TOTAL 42,944.00 48,352.00 59,416.00 59,960.00 68,648.00

  

 Mfg. Onguard Onguard LaCrosse LaCrosse Onguard

 Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #86056 #86056 #24009043 #24009091 #86056

UNIT      

50 pairs PRICE 52.33 60.44 75.67 74.95 71.10

4. Rubber Hip Boots, per specifications or approved equal for size over 13 TOTAL 2,616.50 3,022.00 3,783.50 3,747.50 3,555.00

 

Mfg. LaCrosse Onguard LaCrosse LaCrosse LaCrosse

Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #24009091 #86056 #24009043 #24009091 #24009091

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 45,560.50 51,374.00 63,199.50 63,707.50 72,203.00

*     

GRAND TOTAL (GROUPS 1 & 2) TOTAL 56,868.50 63,369.50 83,825.00 89,530.00 89,890.00

GROUP 1 RUBBER SAFETY BOOTS  

Option Year One - January 1, 2017 - December 31, 2017 UNIT

 500 pairs PRICE 19.85 22.48 39.41 49.95 32.24

1. Rubber Safety Boots, per specifications or approved equal for sizes from 6-13 TOTAL 9,925.00 11,240.00 19,705.00 24,975.00 16,120.00

  

 Mfg. Onguard Onguard LaCrosse LaCrosse Onguard

 Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #86312 #86312 #24009091 #24009043 #86312

UNIT

50 pairs PRICE 33.38 22.48 40.41 49.95 46.08

2. Rubber Safety Boots, per specifications or approved equal for size over 13 TOTAL 1,669.00 1,124.00 2,020.50 2,497.50 2,304.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0399

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Rubber Safety Boots & Rubber Hip Boots

TIME & (January 1, 2016 through December 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 7, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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Mfg. LaCrosse Onguard LaCrosse LaCrosse LaCrosse

Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #24009043 #86312 #24009091 #24009043 #24009043

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 11,594.00 12,364.00 21,725.50 27,472.50 18,424.00

GROUP 2 RUBBER HIP BOOTS  UNIT      

 800 pairs PRICE 55.03 62.32 76.27 79.95 89.39

3. Rubber Hip Boots, per specifications or approved equal for sizes from 6-13 TOTAL 44,024.00 49,856.00 61,016.00 63,960.00 71,512.00

  

 Mfg. Onguard Onguard LaCrosse LaCrosse Onguard

 Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #86056 #86056 #24009043 #24009091 #86056

UNIT      

50 pairs PRICE 53.64 62.32 77.67 79.95 74.06

4. Rubber Hip Boots, per specifications or approved equal for size over 13 TOTAL 2,682.00 3,116.00 3,883.50 3,997.50 3,703.00

 

Mfg. LaCrosse Onguard LaCrosse LaCrosse LaCrosse

Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #24009091 #86056 #24009043 #24009091 #24009091

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 46,706.00 52,972.00 64,899.50 67,957.50 75,215.00

*     

GRAND TOTAL (GROUPS 1 & 2) TOTAL 58,300.00 65,336.00 86,625.00 95,430.00 93,639.00

GROUP 1 RUBBER SAFETY BOOTS  

Option Year Two - January 1, 2018 - December 31, 2018 UNIT

 500 pairs PRICE 20.35 23.17 41.41 53.00 33.58

1. Rubber Safety Boots, per specifications or approved equal for sizes from 6-13 TOTAL 10,175.00 11,585.00 20,705.00 26,500.00 16,790.00

  

 Mfg. Onguard Onguard LaCrosse  Onguard

 Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #86312 #86312 #24009091  #86312

UNIT

50 pairs PRICE 34.22 23.17 42.41 53.00 48.00

2. Rubber Safety Boots, per specifications or approved equal for size over 13 TOTAL 1,711.00 1,158.50 2,120.50 2,650.00 2,400.00

 

Mfg. LaCrosse Onguard LaCrosse  Lacrosse

Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #24009043 #86312 #24009091  #24009043

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 11,886.00 12,743.50 22,825.50 29,150.00 19,190.00

GROUP 2 RUBBER HIP BOOTS  UNIT      

 800 pairs PRICE 56.41 64.25 78.27 84.00 93.11

3. Rubber Hip Boots, per specifications or approved equal for sizes from 6-13 TOTAL 45,128.00 51,400.00 62,616.00 67,200.00 74,488.00

  

 Mfg. Onguard Onguard LaCrosse  Onguard

 Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #86056 #86056 #24009043  #86056
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0399

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Rubber Safety Boots & Rubber Hip Boots

TIME & (January 1, 2016 through December 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 7, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
u
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UNIT      

50 pairs PRICE 54.99 64.25 79.67 84.00 77.15

4. Rubber Hip Boots, per specifications or approved equal for size over 13 TOTAL 2,749.50 3,212.50 3,983.50 4,200.00 3,857.50

 

Mfg. LaCrosse Onguard LaCrosse  Lacrosse

Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #24009091 #86056 #24009043  #24009091

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 47,877.50 54,612.50 66,599.50 71,400.00 78,345.50

*     

GRAND TOTAL (GROUPS 1 & 2) TOTAL 59,763.50 67,356.00 89,425.00 100,550.00 97,535.50

GROUP 1 RUBBER SAFETY BOOTS  

Option Year Three - January 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019 UNIT

 500 pairs PRICE 20.86 23.89 43.41 NO BID 34.98

1. Rubber Safety Boots, per specifications or approved equal for sizes from 6-13 TOTAL 10,430.00 11,945.00 21,705.00  17,490.00

   

 Mfg. Onguard Onguard LaCrosse  Onguard

 Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #86312 #86312 #24009091  #86312

UNIT

50 pairs PRICE 35.08 23.89 44.41 NO BID 50.00

2. Rubber Safety Boots, per specifications or approved equal for size over 13 TOTAL 1,754.00 1,194.50 2,220.50  2,500.00

 

Mfg. LaCrosse Onguard LaCrosse  LaCrosse

Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #24009043 #86312 #24009091  #24009043

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 12,184.00 13,139.50 23,925.50 NO BID 19,990.00

GROUP 2 RUBBER HIP BOOTS  UNIT      

 800 pairs PRICE 57.82 66.24 80.27 NO BID 96.99

3. Rubber Hip Boots, per specifications or approved equal for sizes from 6-13 TOTAL 46,256.00 52,992.00 64,216.00  77,592.00

   

 Mfg. Onguard Onguard LaCrosse  Onguard

 Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #86056 #86056 #24009043  #86056

UNIT      

50 pairs PRICE 56.37 66.24 81.67 NO BID 80.36

4. Rubber Hip Boots, per specifications or approved equal for size over 13 TOTAL 2,818.50 3,312.00 4,083.50  4,018.00

 

Mfg. LaCrosse Onguard LaCrosse  LaCrosse

Mfg. Quoting QUOTING #24009091 #86056 #24009043  #24009091

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 49,074.50 56,304.00 68,299.50 NO BID 81,610.00

*

GRAND TOTAL (GROUPS 1 & 2) TOTAL 61,258.50 69,443.50 92,225.00 NO BID 101,600.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-0399

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Rubber Safety Boots & Rubber Hip Boots

TIME & (January 1, 2016 through December 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 7, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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FIRST YEAR TOTAL TOTAL 56,868.50 63,369.50 83,825.00 89,530.00 89,890.00

EXTENSION 1 58,300.00

EXTENSION 2 59,763.50

EXTENSION 3 61,258.50

2% Net Net Net Net

Terms 10 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery    

 

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Airgas McMaster Wesco Demandstar

Alacorp Meister Supply Co. Wise Safety & Environmental SAWS Website

Alamo Iron Works MSC Industrial Supply

All Safe Industries Orr Safety

Baytech Supply Royall Matthiessen

Border Construction Specialties Safety Conney

Fastenal Safety Shoe Distributors

Furball Wear LLC Safety Supply Inc.

Gil's Boots, Inc. Saf-T-Glove

Hagemeyer San Antonio Lighthouse for the Blind

Henry Frank Wholesale Sunbelt

4


